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October 6, 2023

lofl

Anderson Ford Lincoln Ken Graff Colorado Sid Dillion
Bid Code Make Model Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine
F1 Ford Bronco Sport 1.5L Eco Boost | 2.0L Eco boost | 2.3L Eco Boost| 3.0 Eco boost | 3.3L Hybrid | 1.5L Eco Boost| 2.0L Eco boost 2.3L Eco Boost [ 3.0 Eco boost 3.3L Hybrid 1.5L Eco Boost| 2.0L Eco boost 2.3L Eco Boost [ 3.0 Eco boost 3.3L Hybrid
F1A Ford Bronco Sport $ 29,189.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
F1B Ford Bronco Sport $ 29,189.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $  29,330.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
F2 Ford Edge 1.5L Eco Boost | 2.0L Eco boost | 2.3L Eco Boost| 3.0 Eco boost | 3.3L Hybrid | 1.5L Eco Boost 2.0L Eco boost 2.3L Eco Boost | 3.0 Eco boost 3.3L Hybrid 1.5L Eco Boost 2.0L Eco boost 2.3L Eco Boost [ 3.0 Eco boost 3.3L Hybrid
F2A Ford Edge NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
F2B Ford Edge NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
F2C Ford Edge NO BID $ 33,979.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 33,990.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID
F2D Ford Edge NO BID $ 34,879.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 34,730.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID
F3 Ford Escape 1.5L Eco Boost | 2.0L Eco boost | 2.3L Eco Boost| 3.0 Eco boost | 2.5L hybrid | 1.5L Eco Boost 2.0L Eco boost 2.3L Eco Boost | 3.0 Eco boost 2.5L hybrid 1.5L Eco Boost 2.0L Eco boost 2.3L Eco Boost | 3.0 Eco boost 2.5L hybrid
F3A Ford Escape NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $  25594.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
F3B Ford Escape $ 28,989.00 [ NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 36,911.00 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $  26,630.00 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
F3C Ford Escape NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $  26,978.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
F3D Ford Escape $ 30,989.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 38,412.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $  28,530.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
F4 Ford Explorer 1.5L Eco Boost | 2.0L Eco boost | 2.3L Eco Boost| 3.0 Eco boost | 3.3L Hybrid | 1.5L Eco Boost 2.0L Eco boost 2.3L Eco Boost | 3.0 Eco boost 3.3L Hybrid 1.5L Eco Boost 2.0L Eco boost 2.3L Eco Boost [ 3.0 Eco boost 3.3L Hybrid
F4A Ford Explorer NO BID NO BID $ 34,677.00 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
F4B Ford Explorer NO BID NO BID $ 36,411.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
F4C Ford Explorer NO BID NO BID $ 37,372.00 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
F4D Ford Explorer NO BID NO BID $  38,536.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
F5 Ford Expedition 3.5L Eco Boost N/A N/A N/A N/A 3.5L Eco Boost N/A N/A N/A N/A 3.5L Eco Boost N/A N/A N/A N/A
F5A Ford Expedition $ 48,722.00 NO BID NO BID
F5B Ford Expedition $ 53,316.00 $  57,476.00 $  53,030.00
F5C Ford Expedition $ 51,469.00 NO BID NO BID
F5D Ford Expedition $ 56,054.00 $  60,274.00 $  55,880.00
F6 Ford Expedition MAX 3.5L Eco Boost N/A N/A N/A N/A 3.5L Eco Boost N/A N/A N/A N/A 3.5L Eco Boost N/A N/A N/A N/A
F6A Ford Expedition MAX | § 52,372.00 $  60,274.00 $  55,833.00
F6B Ford Expedition MAX $ 55,109.00 $  68,497.00 NO BID
F6C Ford Expedition MAX | § 56,054.00 $  63,071.00 $  58,630.00
F6D Ford Expedition MAX $ 58,791.00 $  71,295.00 NO BID
Provide a standard percentage (%) discount for
additional Manufacturer Models not listed above
or that may have not been released at the time
of this bid. 8% 5-8% 0.00
Total: $217,796.00 $241,095.00 $223,373.00
Bid tab was calculated by using vehicles that all bidders bidded on.
I Anderson Ford | Ken Groff Sid Dillion
Total of all Market Baskets | $ 2,359,976.00 | $ 2,529,821.00 | $ 2,412,738.00 I
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